
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
City of Edina  •  4801 W. 50th St.  •  Edina, MN 55424 

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL IV. O 

Brian Olson, Public Works Director 
 

☒ 
 

☐ 
 May 7, 2013 

2013 Commodities Purchase – Sand, Rock, Bituminous Materials, Concrete, Water Treatment 

Chemicals, Castings and Covers 

April 30, 2013 May 31, 2013 

 

See attached tabulation 

 

See attached tabulation 

Recommended Quote or Bid: 

Award to companies as listed on attached pages 

General Information: 

This is the bid establishing prices for certain materials used in public works and parks projects.  The prices 

are for a period of one year (May 1, 2013 to April 30, 2014).  The funds for the purchases come from the 

money allocated to the operating section of the budget (1300, 1500 and 5900 accounts).  Prices of previous 

year are compared where applicable; taken as a whole, prices are lower than 2012.  As noted on attachment, 

staff recommends acceptance of low bids (Bituminous material bids factor time/mileage) and rejection of two 

bids as open market prices are more competitive. 

 

Attachments: 

Commodities Bid Proposal 



BID PROPOSAL
CITY OF EDINA

CONTRACT NO. PW 2013
COMMODITIES BID
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NO. PRODUCT DESCRIPTION
BID 

ITEM 
DELIVERED

BID 
ITEM 

PICKED UP
Bid 

Bond
Name of Supplier Miles

1 COARSE WASHED SAND
Gradation 100% - 38

95 - 100 - #4
80 - 100 - #8
55 - 80 - #16
30 - 60 - #30
  5 - 30 - #50
  0 - 10 - #100

Approximately 200 Tons 1 $8.85/Ton n/a x AVR
1 $16.00/Ton n/a x Urban

2 LIMESTONE
Class 2, 100% Crushed
Specification No. 3138-1

Approximately 300 Tons 2 $19.50/Ton n/a x Urban

3 SEAL COAT CHIPS
Specification No. 3127
FA-2
CLASS A TRAPROCK OR GRANITE (must be 
similar in color & texture to traprock)
Gradation - #4 - 85-100%
                     #8 - 10-40%
                     #16 - 0-10%
                     #50 - 0-5%

Approximately 1000 Tons 3 $__________/Ton 3 $__________/Ton  No Bid

4 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT - CRS-2P
      MnDOT Spec No. 2356
Approximately 150 Ton n/a 4 $__________/Ton

No Bid
5 READY MIX BITUMINOUS MATERIALS 

5a (SPNWB330B) MnDOT Non-Wear Spec No. 2360 5a $53.10/Ton 5a $45.35/Ton x BR 11
$48.00/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (EP) 7.4
$46.15/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (BV) 9.1
$45.50/Ton x CS Mc 22
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Approximately 6000 Tons

5b (SPWEA340B) MnDOT  Wear Spec No. 2360 5b $61.05/Ton 5b $53.30/Ton x BR 11

$48.75/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (EP) 7.4

$47.75/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (BV) 9.1

$49.50/Ton x CS Mc 22
Approximately 2000 Tons

5c (SPWEB340B) MnDOT Wear Spec No. 2360 5c $55.10/Ton 5c $47.35/Ton x BR 11
$46.35/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (EP) 7.4
$45.20/Ton x Commercial Asphalt (BV) 9.1
$45.00/Ton x CS Mc 22

Approximately 2000 Tons
*List the mileage ______ and time ______ to pick up material. This will be used to determine low bid.)
Plant location_______________________________________________________________________
Estimated miles from W. 77th Street & Highway 100, Edina__________________________________

6 CONCRETE
Type 3A32-1 - 3900 lbs

Approximately 200 cu yd 6a x AVR
Approximately 400 cu yd 6b x AVR

$116.00/cu yd (1-3 yd minimum, including 
surcharges)
$106.00/cu yd (over 1-3 yd minimum)
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7 EMULSIFIED TACK OIL
Specification 2357 CSS-1H

Approximately 6000 Gallons n/a 7a $__________/Gal No Bid

8 CRACK JOINT SEALER
Specification No. 3725

Approximately 10,000 lbs 8 $__________/lb n/a No Bid

9 HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID
Delivery to all City pump house locations.
Bulk delivery to 140 gal containers

Approximately 123,000 lbs 9 $30.64/cwt n/a x Hawkins
Producer________________________

10 LIQUID CHLORINE
150# Cylinders

Approximately 130,000 lbs/year 10 $32.60/cwt n/a x Hawkins
Delivery to all City pump house locations

11
POLYPHOSPHATE ORTHO-PHOSPHATE BLEND 
WATER TREATMENT CHEMICAL - 50/50 BLEND

Bulk delivery to all City pump house locations
Approximately 9,800 Gallons 11 $5.48/gal n/a x Hawkins

Producer________________________

12 TONKAZORB 3%
Hydrolyzed Manganese Oxide
Bulk delivery to Water Treatment Plant No. 3 
and Water Treatment Plant No. 4 12 $10.42/gal n/a x Hawkins

Approximately 11,000 Gallons

13 CAUSTIC SODA
Bulk; Pumped into City tank located at the 
Aquatic Center, 4300 W. 66th Street

Approximately 1,000 Gallons 13 $33.00/cwt n/a x Hawkins
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14 RED BALL DIAMOND AGGREGATE (PARKS)
100% Crushed Limestone
Gradation - 100% - 3/8

                      35-40% - #60
                      90-100% - #8
                      20-30% - #200
Approximately 1,000 Ton 14a $24.70/Ton 14b $__________/Ton x Urban

15 LANNON STONE WALL REPAIR
Price per square foot to repair
Lannon Stone Walls using City materials

Approximately 1,000 Square Feet 15 $24.50/sq. ft. of face (Labor) x Blackstone
$35.00/sq. ft. of face (Labor) x Urban

16
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A COVERS AND CASTINGS
Complete Casting & 

Lid Casting Only Lid Only

Sanitary Sewer - R1733 with self sealing solid 
cover or approved equal.

16a1 $269.00/ea 16a2 $150.00/ea 16a3 $119.00/ea Ess Bros.

B x
Storm Sewer - Round lid R2548 or approved 
equal.

16b1 $429.00/ea 16b2 $150.00/ea 16b3 $279.00/ea Ess Bros.

C x
Storm Sewer - Rectangular 3067V (no lettering) or 
approved equal.

16c1 $256.00/ea 16c2 $132.00/ea 16c3 $124.00/ea Ess Bros.

D x
Cost of curb box 16d $108.00/ea x Ess Bros.

*Ess shipping $69.00 < $6,000
Free > $6,000

PLEASE NOTE:
No. 9, 10 & 11 will be tied bid and will be awarded together

        300 covers and casting will be a mix.
Recommend accepting bid
Recommend not accepting bid

No. 16A, B, & C will be tied bid and will be awarded together. Award based on complete casting and lid.  Approximately
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